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Five-Year Data Review Report 

This report presents a five-year data review for the fourth operable unit (OU4) of the Pollution Abatement 
Services (PAS) Superfund Site (the Site) located in Oswego, New York based on the first five years of 
polychlorinated biphenyl (PCB) long-term monitoring data. This report has been prepared by Blasland. 
Bouck & Lee, Inc. (BBL) at the request of the United States Environmental Protection Agency (USEPA) 
and on behalf of Niagara Mohawk, a National Grid Company (Niagara Mohawk) and General Motors 
Corporation (GM) (the Settling Defendants). 

Section 1 provides an introduction. Section 2 presents an overview of the PCB long-term monitoring 
activities performed for 0U4. Section 3 presents a summary of the PCB long-term monitoring results. 
Section 4 evaluates the PCB long-term monitoring data obtained over the past five years. Section 5 
provides recommendations. Section 6 contains a list of references cited in this document. 

1. Introduction 

1.1 Purpose and Scope 

This Five-Year Data Review Report is based on the first five years of annual monitoring data collected 
under the USEPA-approved PCB Long-Term Monitoring Plan (Plan) for the Site 0U4 (BBL, 1999a) and 
the USEPA-approved modification to that Plan (BBL, 2001a). The annual monitoring described in the 
Plan is in response to the Consent Decree between USEPA, Niagara Mohawk, and GM that was lodged 
by the Court on December 15, 1998 (USEPA, 1998b), and the September 30, 1997 Record of Decision 
(ROD) for 0 U 4  (USEPA, 1997). The ROD presents the remedial action selected by the USEPA to 
address the PCBs detected in the sediments of White and Wine Creeks and the adjacent wetlands. The 
USEPA-selected remedy presented in the 0 U 4  ROD is long-term annual monitoring of PCB levels in 
sediments and fish in White and Wine Creeks and the adjacent wetlands. 

The Consent Decree states that the USEPA will conduct reviews of whether the remedial action is 
protective of human health and the environment at least every five years (USEPA, 1998b). As stated in 
the ROD, long-term monitoring is being conducted at the Site to document that PCB concentrations in the 
sediments and biota continue to be reduced over time and that further contamination of the area from 
upstream sources is not occumng (USEPA, 1997). 

1.2 Site Description 

The Site, located on 15 acres near the eastern edge of the City of Oswego, New York, is bounded on the 
south by East Seneca Street, and on the east, north, and west by wetlands formed along the stream 
channels of White and Wine Creeks. Just to the north (downstream) of the Site is the confluence of White 
and Wine Creeks. Wine Creek flows approximately 1,800 feet beyond the confluence (northward) to a 
channel and into Lake Ontario, which is approximately 0.5 miles north of the Site. Just east of this 
channel, Wine Creek connects with a wetland adjacent to the residential area known as Smith's Beach. 
Prior to passing through the Site, White and Wine Creeks are proximate to the East Seneca Street Dump 
(also referred to and operated as the Oswego County Landfill), and White Creek is proximate to the 
Niagara Mohawk Fire Training School. The Oswego Castings site is situated upstream of the wetland 
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adjacent to Smith's Beach, a residential area located on the shore of Lake Ontario. 

The area between the Site and Lake Ontario (to the north) is mostly undeveloped and currently includes 
multiple land uses, including a cemetery, a wetland, and commercial and residential areas. 

1.3 Site History and Enforcement Activities Summary 

The PAS facility was a high-temperature, liquid-chemical waste incineration facility which operated from 
1970 through 1977. Beginning in 1973, a series of incidents, including liquid waste spills and the 
overflow of liquid wastes from lagoons into White Creek, led to the involvement of the USEPA and New 
York State Department of Environmental Conservation (NYSDEC) at the Site. Response actions taken 
from 1973 to 1982 by the USEPA, NYSDEC, and Coast Guard resulted in an oil spill cleanup, the 
removal of the incineration facilities, drummed wastes, bulk liquid wastes, and contaminated soils, and 
the closure of two onsite lagoons. According to the 1993 ROD for the Site (USEPA, 1993): these 
removal actions constitute the first operable unit (OU1). 

From 1982 to 1984, the NYSDEC performed a Site Investigation and Remedial Alternatives Evaluation 
of the Site, which was the initial Remedial InvestigatiodFeasibility Study (RVFS) conducted at the Site. 
Based on the results of this study, the USEPA signed a ROD in 1984 (OU2) (USEPA, 1984), which 
specified the following remedial actions: 1) limited excavation and offsite disposal of contaminated 
materials; 2) installation of a perimeter slurry wall; 3) site grading and capping in accordance with 
Resource Conservation and Recovery Act (RCRA) requirements; 4) installation of a leachate collection 
and treatment system; and 5) groundwater monitoring. The NYSDEC implemented the remedial actions 
identified in the 1984 ROD, with the exception of the onsite treatment system. Rather than installing an 
onsite treatment system, the leachate was collected by the NYSDEC from 1986 through 1991 and 
transported offsite to an approved RCRA treatment, storage, and disposal (TSD) facility. 

From 1984 to 1986, the NYSDEC performed an environmental assessment of the area in the vicinity of 
the Site that included White and Wine Creeks. Based on the results of the environmental assessment, the 
NYSDEC determined that no remediation of the creeks was required. 

In 1989, the NYSDEC began a long-term monitoring program for groundwater, surface water, and 
sediment in the vicinity of the Site. The results of soil gas and groundwater sampling, and down-hole 
camera investigations of the existing monitoring wells at the Site, conducted between 1987 and 1990, 
indicated the presence of volatile organic compounds (VOCs) in the groundwater outside the slurry wall 
containment system. 

In September 1990, an Administrative Order on Consent (AOC) was entered into between the USEPA 
and a group of potentially responsible parties (PRF's) to conduct a supplemental RIIFS to evaluate the 
integrity of the existing containment system at the Site, to determine the nature, extent, source, risk, and 
to identify and evaluate remedial alternatives for areas outside the containment system. The supplemental 
RI/FS concluded that chemicals detected in the groundwater outside the containment system were 
attributable to insufficient leachate removal from within the containment system, resulting in a downward 
hydraulic gradient located at the center of the containment system. 

In October 1991, the USEPA and a group of PRPs entered into a leachate-removal AOC. This AOC 
required interim groundwater removal (IGR) of leachate from within the containment system on a 
periodic basis. IGR activities were extended by a second AOC entered into in 1994. The supplemental 
RI report, issued in 1993, concluded that the contamination that was detected in the bedrock groundwater 
outside the containment system was attributable to the downward migration of contaminants through the 
lodgement till beneath the containment system, particularly beneath the area of leachate collection well 
LCW-4 where the lodgement till is relatively thin. The supplemental RI Report noted that the highest 
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level of contaminants occurred in the vicinity of leachate collection well LCW-4 where downward 
hydraulic gradients existed prior to implementation of the IGR program. The report concluded that the 
IGR program effectively reversed these downward hydraulic gradients and mitigated releases from this 
source. 

Based upon the results of the supplemental RVFS, the USEPA signed a ROD on December 29, 1993 for 
0 U 3  (USEPA, 1993). The 1993 ROD incorporated all of the existing components of the 1984 ROD for 
OU2, as well as several additional components. The selected remedy under the 1993 ROD included: 1) 
enhancing the present source control system by optimizing the leachate extraction rate and other operating 
parameters in order to achieve, to the degree practicable, inward horizontal gradients in the overburden 
and upward vertical gradients from the bedrock toward the containment system; 2) connecting 
downgradient residents in the Smith's Beach area, who were using residential wells, to the public water 
supply; and 3) implementing institutional controls on groundwater usage through deed restrictions that 
covered the Site, as well as downgradient locations, including the Smith's Beach area. 

The 1993 ROD also called for several investigations related to the enhancement of the source control 
system. In addition, as there was some uncertainty related to the source of the PCBs detected in the 
sediments in the adjacent wetlands and White and Wine Creeks, the ROD called for a study to determine 
the sources of PCB and pesticide contamination. 

In July 1994, an AOC was entered into by the USEPA and a group of PRPs to conduct a supplemental 
pre-remedial design study (SPRDS) (which was completed in 1996) related to the investigations specified 
in the 1993 ROD. In September 1994, an AOC was entered into between the USEPA and a group of 
PRPs to extend the routine leachate removal called for in the 1991 AOC, and, among other things, to 
connect downgradient residents in the Smith's Beach area, who were using residential wells, to the public 
water supply. The water-supply connections were completed in July 1995. 

In September 1996, an Explanation of Significant Differences (ESD) was issued by the USEPA for 0U3 
(USEPA, 1996). The ESD explained the results of the additional investigations called for in the 1993 
ROD and presented modifications as follows: 1) identified that bedrock pumping would adversely affect 
the containment system, streams, and wetlands; 2) modified the contingent remedy for the treatment of 
the leachate to provide for continued offsite treatment and disposal in lieu of discharge to the City of 
Oswego Waste Water Treatment Plant; and 3) identified that the Site was not the source of pesticides in 
surface water or a present source of PCBs in the creek or wetland sediments, and that other upstream 
sources of PCBs exist. On September 26, 1997, the USEPA and the Performing Settling Defendants 
signed a Consent Decree for the performance of the operation, maintenance, and long-term monitoring 
components of the groundwater remedy described in the 1993 ROD, as clarified by the 1996 ESD. 

Based upon the results of the 1996 SPRDS, a Focused Feasibility Study (FFS) was completed in August 
1997 to identify and evaluate remedial alternatives for the PCB-impacted sediments in the vicinity of the 
Site (ENVIRON, 1997). That FFS determined that PCB-impacted sediments do not pose a human health 
risk and that potential ecological risks to conservatively-selected receptor species (e.g., mink) are only 
marginal. In September 1997, the USEPA signed a ROD for the PCB-impacted sediments in the vicinity 
of the Site (OU4) (USEPA, 1997), which identified no further action with long-term PCB monitoring as 
the selected remedy. 

In September 1998, the USEPA, Niagara Mohawk, and GM (the Settling Defendants) signed the 0 U 4  
Consent Decree, which was subsequently lodged by the Court on December 15, 1998 (USEPA, 1998b). 
The 0 U 4  Consent Decree identified the scope of the remedy as long-term monitoring of PCBs in 
sediments and biota in White and Wine Creeks and the adjacent wetlands. 
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To date, two five-year data review reports have been completed for 0U3. The first five-year data review 
report for 0 U 3  was issued in June 1998 (USEPA, 1998a): and a second five-year data review report for 
0 U 3  was submitted to the USEPA in 2003 (de maximis. inc., 2003). 

2. Overview of the PCB Long-Term Monitoring Activities 

In accordance with the requirements set forth in the 0 U 4  Consent Decree and the 1997 ROD for 0U4 
(USEPA, 1997). the Plan was developed by BBL (BBL, 1999a), the USEPA-approved Supervising 
Contractor identified in the 0 U 4  Consent Decree. The Plan provides a detailed description of the 
requirements, methods, and procedures for monitoring the PCB levels in the sediments and biota (fish) in 
White and Wine Creeks and wetlands adjacent to the Site, and includes the following components: the 
methodology for the selection of a contractor(s); the methodology for the implementation of the Plan; a 
Quality Assurance Project Plan; and a Health and Safety Contingency Plan. The Plan was approved by 
the USEPA in a July 22, 1999 letter (USEPA, 1999). As identified in the Plan, the monitoring activities 
include sampling of surficial sediments (0 to 3 inch), subsurface sediments (3 to 6 inch and 6 to 12 inch), 
suspended sediment (trap), and biota (fish). In the third Annual Progress Report (BBL, 2000), BBL 
proposed that subsurface sediment samples not be collected in the future, and that future long-term 
monitoring events include the continued collection of surficial(0 to 3 inch) sediment, suspended sediment 
(trap), and biota (fish) samples in accordance with the Plan. USEPA approved this modification to the 
Plan on May 30,2001, as documented in BBL's May 3 1,2001 letter to the USEPA (BBL, 2001a). 

2.1 Sample Locations 

The Plan identified the collection of co-located sediment, sediment trap, and biota samples from five 
locations in White and Wine Creeks and the adjacent wetlands. The sample locations were identified by 
the 8-foot sections of iron pipe which were driven into the bank during the initial (1999) annual sampling 
round. These locations were determined based on the results of a probing exercise conducted by BBL in 
1999 to locate prime sediment depositional areas, and have been sampled during each of the five annual 
sampling events. These locations (shown on Figure 1) are identified below. 

Location 1 : Upstream (east) of the Site, in White Creek, near historical sample location SS-1 

Location 2: Adjacent to and northeast of the Site, in White Creek, in the vicinity of Phase 2 SPRDS 
sample location White 11A. 

Location 3: Adjacent to and north of the Site, in White Creek, approximately 50 feet downstream of 
historical sample location SS-3. 

Location 4: North of the Site in White Creek, in the vicinity of Phase 2 SPRDS sample location 
White 12B. 

Location 5: Downstream (northwest) of the Site, and downstream of the confluence of White and 
Wine Creeks, in the vicinity of historical sample location SS-4A. 

2.2 Sediment Sampling 

During the five annual sampling events conducted to date, sediment samples were collected by BBL at 
each of the aforementioned locations using a stainless steel corer. At each sample location, the corer was 
pushed into the sediment, and slowly pulled out. The sediment cores were extracted from the stainless 
steel tube onto an aluminum pan using a brass push rod. The sediment samples were homogenized, and 
placed in the appropriate sampling jars for shipment to the laboratory, in accordance with procedures 
identified in the Plan. 














































































